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Portugal ,to use rebel
Renamo in Moz Army
ROME. - Ponugal has
been asked to hclp train
a ncw Mozarnbican
army,  which wi l l  in tc-
grate vcteran rebels
from the l5-ycar-old
civil war.

Thc requcsl was
madc a day ahcr Mo.
zambique President
Joaquim Chissano and
rcbcl leadcr Afonso Dh-
lakama signed ao agrec-
ment  p ledging to s ign a
ceasc-fire by Octobcr l.

Thc agtccment
crowned two years of
talks in Romc involving
the Right-wing Renamo
rcbe ls and the forme r
Murx is t  Maputo Cov-
( ' r n n l C n l .

Ponuguese r l rp l l l -

nratic ubscrven lo thc
talkt met on Saturday
both with Mr Chissano
and Mr Dhlakama.

Usbon. was erpcctcd
lo acccpt thc task. What
to do about the rebels
aftcr thc war cnds has
bcen r stichy issuc in the
talks, which have bccn
mcdiated by lraly, a
Romc-bascd Carholic
charily and thc Mozam-
biquc Catholic church.

Rcnamo claims to
havc 23 000 fightcn
while the govemmenl
boasts an army of
50 000, although media-
lors bclievc both sidel
havc far fcwcr troops.

Undcr thc proposed
agreemcol, lhc national

army would numbcr
25 ffi troops, half ol
thcm coming from thc
Renamo ranks.

Thc Portuguese took
on a similar task in An-
gola following thc cnd
of civil strife in that for-
mcr African colony of
Lisboo.

Many of thc military
details will bc workcd
on in thc nert fcw days
whcn negoliators from
both sidcs continuc lo
mcel in Romc after rhc
cxpcacd departurc o[
Mr Chissano and Mr
Dhlakama.

Thc composition of
thc national policc was
also cxpccted to bc dis-
orsscd. Sapa-AP.


